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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 
 

UNLEASH YOUR INNER REAL ESTATE WARRIOR  
START BY PASSING THE CA REAL ESTATE EXAM NOW 

 
Westwood, CA, February 21, 2012.   A call to battle the CA DRE exams is being trumpeted for the 
upcoming test dates.  As agent-elect and agents sitting for their brokers’ exam know, these are 
designed to test their mettle.  To prepare, some just hit the books, some have already taken it a few 
times and think they are prepared, and others take prep courses.  “One of the easiest ways to pass the 
CA Department of Real Estate exam is to know what’s on it! That’s why I’m hosting the best test prep 
course available, PASS THE TEST NOW,” says Keller Williams Realty - Westside’s CEO and Team 
Leader, Wendy Davis.    
 
Keller Williams Realty received Innovator of the Year in 2011 for its leading edge technology.  While the 
National Association of Realtors notes a 7.4% increase in agent productivity in 2011, Keller Williams 
increased its agent productivity to 19.5%! Through innovative courses and developed processes that 
drive business, agent support continues with a local franchisee’s hosting a prep course for all New 
Sales Agents and Brokers on February 25, 2012 from 8:30 to 4:30 pm.  
 
“This is more than a DRE compliance course,” says instructor Dwight Norris, “Besides sitting for the 
exam, if you are thinking about getting (back) into real estate practice, this course will provide you with 
a high level understanding of what’s required and new.”   
 
Unleashing your inner real estate warrior by passing the DRE-required Sales Agent or Broker exam is 
made simpler by honing your skills with master instructors.  Statistics support proof positive that prep 
courses increase your odds of passing the test.    “The first time pass rate of our students is 60% higher 
than studying without our preparation,” says broker course instructor Bruce Legg.  “Spend your day the 
right way without overspending for the right tools.  We teach you what you need to know in order to 
pass the first time.” 
 
As more agents come online or return to the field of real estate, preparation is only half the challenge in 
capturing the recovering real estate market.  The other half of the challenge is leveraging that 
knowledge with the right opportunity.  “I’ll also provide students an overview of why Keller Williams is 
75,000 agents strong and pushing their way past the second largest real estate company in the world to 
number one…and lunch is on me,” says Wendy Davis.  
 
To learn more about this course go to WWW.PASSTHETESTNOW.com or call to reserve your space at 
(310) 482-2500. 


